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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NUMBER: 141/2022 

Thank you for your request for information regarding PNC information markers, which has now 
been considered. 

Applicant Questions: 

From information disclosed in previously published FOI requests, there are various types of 
'markers' on PNC relating to individuals that are sought by police for a number of reasons, for 
example 'wanted', 'locate and trace', 'missing' etc. 

1. Please disclose a complete list of these 'markers' together with descriptions of each type

2. Please disclose all guidelines on the use of each of these markers. This may include internal
policies, standard operating procedures, practice directions, etc.

3. For example, when would police officers use a 'locate and trace' marker as opposed to a
'wanted' marker?

4. Please disclose all documents relating to the review and cancellation of markers, including
review schedules, criteria to be considered when removing or cancelling a marker, etc. If this would
depend on other factors such as seriousness of the offence or time passed, please also disclose this
information.

NPCC Response: 

Due to the wording of your request, the NPCC has interpreted your request for ‘markers’ to be in 
relation to nominal information markers on PNC. The NPCC does hold information captured by 
question 1 of your request. There has been one minor redaction under Section 23(1) Information 
provided by or relating to Security Bodies. I have provided the list of PNC Information Markers 
alongside a description of each type below. 

Outside of the Act, information in relation to ‘Wanted/Missing orders’ and their use can be found 
within the PNC manual available via what do they know. 

In relation to question 2, the NPCC does not hold ‘guidelines on the use of each of these markers’, 
which in turn invalidates question 3. 

mailto:npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk
https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/cy/request/704857/response/1688218/attach/4/61120%20Annex%20A%20PNC%20Manual%20v20.01%20Redacted%20v4.pdf?cookie_passthrough=1


 
The NPCC does not hold documents relating to the review and cancellation of Information Markers. 
However outside of the Freedom of information Act, information on the review and deletion of 
Warning Signals on PNC can be found on the PNC manual (p395). 
 
In wishing to assist you further, individual forces often publish their own PNC policies, an example 
of which can be found here. 
 
Additionally, there is a new Code of Practice being drawn up in relation the PNC, see the current 
consultation and glossary which may be of interest to you. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Fiona Greenlees 
npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk  
www.npcc.police.uk 
 
COMPLAINT RIGHTS 
 
Internal Review 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the response you have been provided with, in compliance with the 
Freedom of Information legislation, you can lodge a complaint with NPCC to have the decision 
reviewed within 20 working days of the date of this response. The handling of your request will be 
looked at by someone independent of the original decision, and a fresh response provided. 
 
It would be helpful, if requesting a review, for you to articulate in detail the reasons you are not 
satisfied with this reply. 
 
If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to NPCC Freedom of 
Information, c/o PO Box 481, Fareham, Hampshire, PO14 9FS. 
 
If, after lodging a complaint with NPCC, you are still unhappy with the outcome, you may make an 
application to the Information Commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe 
House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
Annex A 
 
Legislation – Section 16 
 

(1) It shall be the duty of a public authority to provide advice and assistance, so far as it would 
be reasonable to expect the authority to do so, to persons who propose to make, or have 
made, requests for information to it. 

 
Legislation - Section 23 Information supplied by, or concerning, certain security bodies  
 

(1) Information held by a public authority is exempt information if it was directly or indirectly 
supplied to the public authority by, or relates to any of the bodies specified in subsection (3)  
 
This is an absolute exemption and there is no requirement to consider the public interest test. 

 
 

Microsoft%20Word%20-%20PNC%20Manual,%20v20.01%20(Redacted%20v4).docx%20(whatdotheyknow.com)
https://www.hampshire.police.uk/SysSiteAssets/foi-media/hampshire-constabulary/policies/29800-policypolicenationalcomputerpnc.pdf
https://assets.college.police.uk/s3fs-public/2022-03/Code-of-Practice-for-PNC-and-LEDS-2022-consultation.pdf
https://assets.college.police.uk/s3fs-public/2022-03/Code-of-practice-PNC-LEDS-Glossary.pdf
mailto:npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk
http://www.acpo.police.uk/


 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Question 1: 
 
 
 



 
 
 

 
 



 

 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


