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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NUMBER: 227/2023

Thank you for your request for information regarding an Information Sharing Agreement; which
has now been considered.

Applicant Question:

1. Canyouinform me as to whether the Insolvency Service has an information sharing
agreement with Police National Computer (PNC)

2. If so, when was the first signed.

3. Canyou supply a copy if one exists

NPCC Response:
The NPCC does not hold information captured by your request.

The NPCC does not hold an Information Sharing Agreement between the Insolvency Service with
the Police National Computer (PNC).

Outside of the Act, and as a gesture of good will in wishing to be open and transparent, ACRO does
hold an Information Sharing Agreement (ISA) between the National Police Chiefs’ Council ACRO
Criminal Records Office and Insolvency Service (IS) which provides a date of issue of 12/08/2020.

The first ISA formally signed between ACRO and the IS was 2017.

| have pleasure in providing you with a copy of the ISA referred to above with minor redaction of
direct contact details and signatures. | wish to stress that these redactions have been made
outside of the Freedom of Information legislative platform and no exemptions are engaged.

Sherry Traquair
NPCC Freedom of Information Officer & Decision Maker

www.npcc.police.uk

COMPLAINT RIGHTS

Internal Review

1st Floor, 10 Victoria Street, London SW1H ONN T 020 7084 8950 F 020 7084 8951

n O O mm


mailto:npcc.foi.request@cru.pnn.police.uk
http://www.acpo.police.uk/

If you are dissatisfied with the response you have been provided with, in compliance with the
Freedom of Information legislation, you can lodge a complaint with NPCC to have the decision
reviewed within 20 working days of the date of this response. The handling of your request will be
looked at by someone independent of the original decision, and a fresh response provided.

It would be helpful, if requesting a review, for you to articulate in detail the reasons you are not
satisfied with this reply.

If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to NPCC Freedom of Information,
c/o PO Box 481, Fareham, Hampshire, PO14 9FS.

If, after lodging a complaint with NPCC, you are still unhappy with the outcome, you may make an
application to the Information Commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe
House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.






