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22/09/2022 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NUMBER:   298/2022 

Thank you for your request for information regarding the Police National Computer; which has now 
been considered. 

Applicant Question: 

1. Please can you confirm the full name, contact and ICO registration details for the data
controller of the Police National Computer.

2. Please can you confirm the full name of all data processors who have been authorised to
have direct access and/or connection to the Police National Computer. (This includes
processors with read-only, write and admin access).

3. Please can you supply the privacy policy/notice for users whose data is stored and/or
processed within the Police National Computer.

4. Please can you supply the retention policy which details the retention periods of any data
which is stored and/or processed within the Police National Computer.

NPCC Response: 

1. The NPCC does not hold information captured by your request.  I have consulted with the
National Policing Portfolio for the Police National Computer (PNC) who confirm that the
information that you seek isn’t recorded within the Portfolio.  The lead Data Controller for
the NPCC is DCC Nav Malik.

2. The NPCC PNC Portfolio does not hold recorded information captured by this part of your
request.  A consideration for you may be to make a request with the Home Office for the
Hendon Data Centre.

3. The NPCC PNC Portfolio does not hold recorded information captured by this part of your
request.  A consideration for you may be to make a request with the Home Office for the
Hendon Data Centre.

4. The NPCC does hold information captured by this part of your request and I have pleasure
in providing this information to you.  The NPCC Deletion of Records from National Police
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Systems (PNC/NDNAD/IDENT1) can be found here.  The specific part relating to your 
request is outlined at paragraph 1.5.5. 

 
Yours sincerely 
 
Sherry Traquair 
NPCC Freedom of Information Officer & Decision Maker 
 
www.npcc.police.uk 
 
 
COMPLAINT RIGHTS 
 
Internal Review 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the response you have been provided with, in compliance with the 
Freedom of Information legislation, you can lodge a complaint with NPCC to have the decision 
reviewed within 20 working days of the date of this response. The handling of your request will be 
looked at by someone independent of the original decision, and a fresh response provided. 
 
It would be helpful, if requesting a review, for you to articulate in detail the reasons you are not 
satisfied with this reply. 
 
If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to NPCC Freedom of Information, 
c/o PO Box 481, Fareham, Hampshire, PO14 9FS. 
 
If, after lodging a complaint with NPCC, you are still unhappy with the outcome, you may make an 
application to the Information Commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe 
House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. 
 

https://www.acro.police.uk/ACRO/media/ACRO-Library/Deletion-of-Records-from-National-Police-Systems-(Guidance)-v2-1-April-2020.pdf
http://www.acpo.police.uk/

