
 
 

 

c/o PO BOX 481  
Fareham  

Hampshire  
PO14 9FS 

 
Tel: 02380 478922  

Email: npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk  
 

 
08/08/2025 
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NUMBER:  2410/2025 
 
Thank you for your request for information regarding Data Governance Roles; which has now been considered. 
 
Applicant Question: 
 

1. Name of organisation SIRO (Senior Information Risk Owner) or similar post (Chief Information Governance Officer 
etc), or responsible person for SIRO duties.  

2. Contact email of person named in request No. 1.  
3. Name of organisation DPO (Data Protection Officer) or responsible person for DPO duties.  
4. Contact email of DPO.  
5. Nominated Caldicott Guardian.  
6. Contact email of Caldicott Guardian.  
7. Have you appointed, or do you plan on appointing or delegating the position of IAO to any employees?  
8. Who is responsible for the leading IAO structure, I.E. the SIRO/’Lead’ IAO/Head of Governance/Head of Corporate 

Services etc? 
9. Who is responsible for reviewing and implementing any training needs for the IAO’s?   
10. Spend on external IAO training over the past 5 years, per year (financial year), or is the training delivered internally 

(if at all)?  
11. Are you or have you considered becoming ISO 27001 compliant or certified?  
12. Following on from Q11, if so whom is/would be responsible for implementation or exploration of ISO 27001? (as in, 

the person/job title)  

NPCC Response: 
 

1. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request. 
The NPCC IAO Policy records this as the Chair of the NPCC.  The Chair of the NPCC is Chief Constable 
Gavin Stephens. 
 

2. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request. 
info@npcc.police.uk  
 

3. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request.  This information is withheld in full 
by virtue of S40(2) Personal Information.  The NPCC DPO is not named on the ICO public register. 
 

4. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request.  dpo@npcc.police.uk  

mailto:npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk
mailto:info@npcc.police.uk
mailto:dpo@npcc.police.uk


 
 

 

5. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 

6. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 

7. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 
Please find attached NPCC IAO Policy provided in full.  The information captured by your request is found 
detailed at 4.2 and Annex A. 
 

8. The NPCC does hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 
This is set out within the NPCC IAO Policy at 1.4, the NPCC Chair, CC Gavin Stephens. 
 

9. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 

10. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 

11. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 
 

12. The NPCC does not hold recorded information captured by your request. 

Yours sincerely 
 
Sherry Traquair 
Freedom of Information Officer & Decision Maker 
 
www.npcc.police.uk 
 
 
COMPLAINT RIGHTS 
 
Internal Review 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the response you have been provided with in compliance with the Freedom of 
Information legislation, you can lodge a complaint with NPCC to have the decision reviewed within 40 working 
days of the date of this response.  
 
The handling of your request will be looked at by someone independent of the original decision and a fresh 
response provided. 
 
It would be helpful, if requesting a review, for you to articulate in detail the reasons you are not satisfied with this 
reply. 
 
Any request for an internal review will be acknowledged and responded to, based on the specific wording of your 
initial request only. 

http://www.acpo.police.uk/


 
 

 

 
We ask that any rationale to request an internal review, does not include any requests for new information and 
ask that these be submitted by separate email.  We will acknowledge as a new request and may aggregate to 
your initial request in compliance with the legislation. 
 
If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to NPCC Freedom of Information, c/o PO Box 
481, Fareham, Hampshire, PO14 9FS. 
 
 
  



 
 

 

Annex A  
 
Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 requires the NPCC, when refusing to provide  
information by way of exemption in question and (c) states why the exemption applies. In accordance with the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000 this letter acts as a refusal notice to those aspects of your request.   
 
Legislation – Section 16 
 

(1) It shall be the duty of a public authority to provide advice and assistance, so far as it would be 
reasonable to expect the authority to do so, to persons who propose to make, or have made, requests 
for information to it. 

 
 

 
 


