

c/o PO BOX 481
Fareham
Hampshire
PO14 9FS

Tel: 02380 478922

Email: npcc.foi.request@npfdu.police.uk

07/04/2026

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST REFERENCE NUMBER: 2843/2026

Thank you for your request for information regarding Op Navette Arrest, Charge and Conviction Data, which has now been considered.

Applicant Question:

I would be grateful if you could provide the following information, broken down by each police force, with reference to the policing and criminal proceedings carried out as part of Operation Navette in response to violent disorder that followed the mass stabbing carried out in Southport:

1. Total number of arrests made as part of Operation Navette
2. Total number of individuals charged
3. Total number of individuals convicted

NPCC Response:

The NPCC does hold information captured by questions of 1 and 2 of your request and it is provided to you below.

Force	Arrests	Charges
Avon and Somerset Constabulary	82	52
Bedfordshire Police	0	0
British Transport Police	11	4
Cambridgeshire Constabulary	2	1
Cheshire Constabulary	21	11
City of London Police	0	0
Cleveland Police	186	103
Cumbria Constabulary	25	15
Derbyshire Constabulary	15	7
Devon & Cornwall Police	27	27
Dorset Police	12	9

Durham Constabulary	96	39
Dyfed-Powys Police	3	1
Essex Police	8	3
Gloucestershire Constabulary	115	3
Greater Manchester Police	131	95
Gwent Police	7	2
Hampshire Constabulary	34	29
Hertfordshire Constabulary	3	0
Humberside Police	116	81
Kent Police	20	7
Lancashire Constabulary	75	34
Leicestershire Police	8	7
Lincolnshire Police	10	9
Merseyside Police	221	107
Metropolitan Police Service	162	59
Norfolk Constabulary	1	0
North Wales Police	9	4
North Yorkshire Police	30	13
Northamptonshire Police	10	4
Northumbria Police	140	55
Nottinghamshire Police	28	13
Police Scotland	7	7
Police Service of Northern Ireland	68	52
South Wales Police	8	3
South Yorkshire Police	148	104
Staffordshire Police	203	59
Suffolk Constabulary	1	0
Surrey Police	7	1
Sussex Police	19	5
Thames Valley Police	25	7
Warwickshire Police	0	0
West Mercia Police	9	3
West Midlands Police	45	39
West Yorkshire Police	102	54
Wiltshire Police	0	0
Total	2250	1128

Please note that the figures provided reflect data submitted by forces during a live operational environment. As forces continue to review and update their own records, including the designation and categorisation of individuals, it is possible that local figures may differ from those held centrally.

In addition, operational activity, investigative outcomes, and subsequent force-level amendments can result in changes over time. The data presented here therefore represents the position based on the returns received at the point of extraction.

The NPCC does not hold information captured by part 3 of your request as this is not being collated centrally.

A consideration for you is to make a request with individual police forces in relation to their own locally held data

Unfortunately, I do not hold a public facing list of force FOI contact details, however they will be available [here](#).

You are able to send a request to multiple forces by way of one email, with each force having a lawful responsibility under the Act to respond to you.

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Officer & Decision Maker

www.npcc.police.uk

COMPLAINT RIGHTS

Internal Review

Any request for an internal review will be acknowledged and responded to, based on the specific wording of your initial request only.

We ask that any rationale to request an internal review, does not include any requests for new information and ask that these be submitted by separate email. We will acknowledge as a new request and may aggregate to your initial request in compliance with the legislation.

If you are dissatisfied with the response you have been provided with in compliance with the Freedom of Information legislation, you can lodge a complaint with NPCC to have the decision reviewed within 40 working days of the date of this response.

The handling of your request will be looked at by someone independent of the original decision and a fresh response provided.

It would be helpful, if requesting a review, for you to articulate in detail the reasons you are not satisfied with this reply.

If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to NPCC Freedom of Information, c/o PO Box 481, Fareham, Hampshire, PO14 9FS.

Annex A

Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 requires the NPCC, when refusing to provide information by way of exemption in question and (c) states why the exemption applies. In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000 this letter acts as a refusal notice to those aspects of your request.

Legislation – Section 16

- (1) It shall be the duty of a public authority to provide advice and assistance, so far as it would be reasonable to expect the authority to do so, to persons who propose to make, or have made, requests for information to it.